


6
THE PRESS TIMES, SEPTEMBER 24, 2021 - PAGE 6

said ‘Yep, we think he is a 
kid with a disability, but we 
don’t feel like he needs spe-
cialized education.’ So in 
March or April 2020, we got 
his 504, as a third grader, af-
ter having issues since 4K.”

As an information and 
assistance specialist at 
the Aging & Disability Re-
source Center of  Brown 
County, Erickson is famil-
iar with the special educa-
tion system, which she said 
helped her move through 
the process with her sons.

“I think that if  I didn’t do 
the job that I do, and have 
the people around me that 
I do, it would (have been) 
an even bigger nightmare,” 
she said.

Erickson said one of  the 
struggles she and other par-
ents like her face with stu-
dents who have less visible 
disabilities is others misun-
derstanding disabilities as 
misbehavior.

“I think it is very chal-
lenging if  you don’t feel 
like you can push back, es-
pecially with kids that fall 
into the category like mine, 

where it can be looked at 
as behaviorally,” she said. 
“I think the behavior kids 
are more likely to see repri-
mand, instead of  exploring, 
if  they have a disability.”

Erickson is proactive and 
plans ahead as much as 
she can to ensure her sons 
get the help they need each 
school year.

“Every year, I have a 
full profile on my kids’ 
strengths, weaknesses, 
what they do well, what 
they need help with and I 
make copies and make sure 
every teacher touching my 
child has one,” she said. 

But she acknowledges it 
isn’t something all parents 
are able to do.

“I think we as a com-
munity need to do a better 
job at educating,” Erickson 
said. “Like I said, I have 
just kind of  fallen into the 
resources. And being my 
children have autism, I 
have an obsessive trait of  
now I need to find out ev-
erything that I need to do to 
make this child as success-
ful as possible, but we don’t 
all have those abilities to do 
that.”

As for district outreach, 
Erickson said while the 
e�ort is there, but there 
seems to be a disconnect 
between individual schools 
and the district.

“I think the individual 
schools do a good job meet-
ing the kids where they are 
at and recognizing all their 
strengths,” she said. “The 
district could improve on 
providing more consistent 
messaging for sta� and 
parents, and ensure that 
important communica-
tion is filtering down to all 
schools... There should be 
continuity and uniformity 
between them. I feel like at 
times the schools are very 
individualized, which I 
don’t think is always benefi-
cial because the messages 
aren’t getting shared.”

Unexpected journey
Welcoming Christopher 

into their family through 
adoption at age 4, Ash-
waubenon parents Al and 
Julie Schmitz embarked on 
a journey they never antici-
pated.

“I think the No. 1 obstacle 
that we had was it is very 

isolating to be a parent of  a 
special needs student,” Julie 
Schmitz said. “I had no idea 
the amount of  programs 
available in Ashwaubenon 
and Green Bay for students 
with special needs. When 
you don’t need them, you 
don’t know about them.”

She said when they be-
gan fostering Christopher 
in late April 2012, he was al-
ready in the Birth to Three 
Program.

“He transferred from his 
home district to Ashwaube-
non with an IEP and that 
has just continued on,” she 
said.

Schmitz said it was an 
easy transition for his fam-
ily.

As a teacher herself, 
Schmitz said she is familiar 
with the vocabulary, but 
not all families have that 
knowledge.

“I understand how with 
some people this is a very 
scary bit of information they 
are getting,” she said. “We 
were at a very di�cult point 
here in our parenting jour-
ney, too. I called Cormier 
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Christopher Schmitz, an eighth-grader at Parkview Middle 
School in Ashwaubenon, was adopted by his family at age 4. 
He is on the autism spectrum, and his family credits the school 
district with being receptive to his needs. 
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